Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Dawn C. Staub, Purchasing Manager, (585) 753-1100

BID PROJECT:

Furnish: Video Vehicle Presence Detection System; Field Hardened
Network IP Camera-Fixed; IP Camera-PTZ

BID PROJECT #: 0605-16

BID DATE: July 15,2016 11:00 am

BUYER & PHONE #:

Sharon A. Berndt, (585) 753-1110

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING

AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR

AMOUNT BID

Citilog, Inc.
2 Bala Plaza, Suite 300
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

Group | Item 1 Total - $12,375.00

Group | Item 2 Total - $158,400.00
Group Il Item 1 Total - $12,856.00
Group Il Item 2 Total - $60,040.00

Econolite Control Products, Inc.
3 Crestwood Drive
Clifton Park, NY 12065

Group | Item 1 Total - $15,138.60 (corrected total)
Group | Item 2 Total - $159,791.36 (corrected total)
Group Il Item 1 Total - NO BID

Group Il Item 2 Total - NO BID

Highway Tech Signal Equipment Sales, Inc.
6 Sabattus Road

PO Box 1209

Sabattus, ME 04280

Group | Item 1 Total - $18,140.00
Group | Item 2 Total - $120,320.00
Group Il Item 1 Total - $9,928.00
Group Il Item 2 Total - $58,235.00

Marbelite Company, Inc.
1913 Atlantic Avenue

Group | Item 1 Total - $8,915.00
Group | ltem 2 Total - $114,144.00

PO Box 239 Group Il Item 1 Total - $11,656.00
Manasquan, NJ 08736 Group Il Item 2 Total - $66,196.00
R-Options, Inc. Group | Item 1 Total - NO BID

30 Industrial Park Circle, Suite 1
Rochester, NY 14624

Group | Item 2 Total - NO BID $
Group Il Item 1 Total - $9,880.00 (corrected total)
Group Il Item 2 Total - $55,955.00 (corrected total)




